
AGENDA FOR  

REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

TUESDAY, JULY 2, 2024 – 5:00 P.M.  

1. Pledge of Allegiance

2. Call to Order

- Roll Call and Establishment of Quorum

3. Approval of Agenda

- Council Changes
- Staff Changes

4. Approval of Minutes

A. June 18, 2024

5. Audience Participation (10-minute time limit for items not on the agenda)

6. Consent Agenda

7. Scheduled Public Hearings

A. Assessments for Delinquent Accounts (Resolutions #36/#37)

8. Old Business

A. Accounts Payable/Payroll Coordinator Position

9. Regular Agenda

A. Solid Waste Collection Proposals
B. Donation for Zeb Gray Shelter Bathroom (Resolution #38)
C. Memorial Park Bathroom Project (Resolution #39)
D. Donation from Redwood Falls Fire Relief Association (Resolution #40)
E. Donation from Redwood Library Foundation (Resolution #41)
F. Police Department Body Worn Camera Audit

10. Other Items and Communications

A. Council Items
B. Staff Items

11. Paid Bills and Claims – For Informational Purposes

A. City of Redwood Falls Accounts Payable Summary

12. Adjournment



MINUTES 

REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING 

CITY OF REDWOOD FALLS, MINNESOTA 

TUESDAY, JUNE 18, 2024 

Pursuant to due call and notice thereof, a regular meeting of the Redwood Falls City Council was called to order 
in the Municipal Chambers on Tuesday, June 18, 2024, at 5:00 p.m. 

Roll call indicated Council Members Matt Smith, Denise Kerkhoff, Jim Sandgren, Larry Arentson, and John T. 
Buckley were present, constituting a quorum. Mayor Tom Quackenbush was absent. 

Council President John T. Buckley presided over the meeting. 

Also present were City Administrator Keith Muetzel, Finance Director Kari Klages, City Attorney Trenton 
Dammann, Public Works Project Coordinator Jim Doering, and Deputy City Clerk Caitlin Kodet. 

A motion was made by Council Member Kerkhoff and seconded by Council Member Arentson to approve the 
agenda. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 

A motion was made by Council Member Sandgren and seconded by Council Member Smith to approve the 
June 4, 2024, minutes as presented.  Motion passed by unanimous vote. 

Zoning Administrator Matt Johnson was present to introduce Resolution No. 34 of 2024 – A Resolution of the City 
of Redwood Falls Approving the Proposed Planned Unit Development for Normandale Mobile Home Park Located at 201 
Normandale Road.  

Brian Ertel, owner of Normandale Mobile Home Park was present. 

Mr. Johnson stated the City received a request for a Planned Unit Development from Brian Ertel, owner of the 
Normandale Mobile Home Park located at 201 Normandale Road. Mr. Ertel has requested the Planned Unit Development 
overlay district because the current configuration of the park does not allow adequate space to complete the desired 
infrastructure improvements. Currently, the street and all underground utilities within the mobile home park are considered 
private property and maintained by the property owner. To bring the street and utilities to municipal standards, Mr. Ertel 
would need to reduce the front property line setbacks from the road to the structures. 

Mr. Ertel stated he has applied for and been approved for grant funding to upgrade the infrastructure within the 
property.   

Mr. Johnson stated the PUD request will not change the current zoning of the (R-M) Manufactured Home Park 
District but will allow for modifications to the front setback requirements and property configuration. Mr. Ertel has worked 
with City Staff to ensure the proposed infrastructure meets the necessary requirements and provided a concept site plan.  

City Attorney Dammann stated approval of the PUD allows Mr. Ertel to proceed with the final plat and 
development agreement. If the PUD is approved, Mr. Ertel will improve the street, sanitary sewer, storm sewer, and water 
within the property. Once the street meets municipal standards, Mr. Ertel intends to dedicate the street to the City as a 
public right-of-way and continue to operate the property as a manufactured housing community. The Planning Commission 
recommends approval of the Planned Unit Development with the findings of fact and conditions as outlined in Resolution 
No. 34. 

A motion was made by Council Member Smith and seconded by Council Member Arentson to waive the reading of 
Resolution No. 34 of 2024 – A Resolution of the City of Redwood Falls Approving the Proposed Planned Unit 
Development for Normandale Mobile Home Park Located at 201 Normandale Road. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 
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A motion was made by Council Member Sandgren and seconded by Council Member Kerkhoff to approve 

Resolution No. 34 of 2024 – A Resolution of the City of Redwood Falls Approving the Proposed Planned Unit 
Development for Normandale Mobile Home Park Located at 201 Normandale Road. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 

 
Miranda Wendlandt, CPA and CFE with CliftonLarsonAllen was present to give an overview of the 2023 audit 

results for the City of Redwood Falls.  
 

Ms. Wendlandt stated this was an unmodified clean audit with no internal control finding. Due to the amount of 
Federal funds received for Highway Planning & Construction, a Single Audit was required. The Single Audit found that 
the City complied with the specific funding requirements. The audit findings are an indication of the City’s high-quality 
internal control process, reviews that are in place, and overall attention Staff gives to the year-end balances.  

 
A motion was made by Council Member Smith and seconded by Council Member Arentson to accept the 2023 

City Audit results and reports as submitted. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 
 

Finance Director Klages introduced Resolution No. 35 of 2024 – Resolution Committing to Certain Financial 
Obligations for the Sewer System in Conjunction with Federal and State Funding for the Wastewater Treatment Facility 
Improvements Project.    

 
Ms. Klages stated on April 16, 2024, Council awarded the bid for the Wastewater Treatment Facility 

Improvements project. The total overall cost of the project including non-construction costs is $9,450,010.00. The 
project’s funding source includes a Point Source Implementation Grant (PSIG) of $6,718,137.00, as well as, a low 
interest loan through the Public Facilities Authority (PFA) in the amount of $2,731,873.00. 

 
Ms. Klages stated one of the requirements of the PFA Clean Water Revolving Loan program is for the City to 

commit to maintaining revenues sufficient to pay for system expenses, including debt service, operations and 
maintenance. The anticipated rate increases in Resolution No. 35 are based on the most recent approved rate study 
updated to include this PFA loan. These anticipated rate increases are subject to change based on the City’s future 
annual rate studies.   

 
A motion was made by Council Member Kerkhoff and seconded by Council Member Sandgren to waive the 

reading of Resolution No. 35 of 2024 – Resolution Committing to Certain Financial Obligations for the Sewer System 
in Conjunction with Federal and State Funding for the Wastewater Treatment Facility Improvements Project. Motion 
passed by unanimous vote. 

 
A motion was made by Council Member Arentson and seconded by Council Member Smith to approve Resolution 

No. 35 of 2024 – Resolution Committing to Certain Financial Obligations for the Sewer System in Conjunction with 
Federal and State Funding for the Wastewater Treatment Facility Improvements Project. Motion passed by unanimous 
vote. 

 
City Attorney Dammann introduced the Approval of Plat Correction Pursuant to Minn. Stat. §505.174. 

 
Mr. Dammann stated on April 19, 2022, Council approved the preliminary plats and final plats for the parcels 

described as the Reflection Prairie Addition (Parcel #62-008-2020) and Reflection Ridge Business Park Addition (Parcel 
#62-005-4020). The approved final plats were filed with the office of the Redwood County Recorder on July 7, 2022. 
Pursuant to Minn. Stat. § 505.174, when a land plat has been executed and filed in the office of the county recorder of the 
county where the land is situated, and the plat fails to correctly describe the land to be platted, the registered surveyor who 
prepared such plat or subdivision may execute a certificate stating the nature of the error, omission or defect and stating the 
correct information to correct such error.  
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Mr. Dammann stated a Land Surveyors Certificate of Correction to Plat has been prepared to change the street 

name of Kestral Lane to Foxtail Road. Kestral Lane currently runs east and west, the length of two lots, connecting Foxtail 
Road and Sunflower Road. During the address assignment process, City Staff noticed an issue with the naming of Kestral 
Lane. To eliminate potential confusion while locating Foxtail Road, Staff is recommending to eliminate Kestral Lane by 
extending Foxtail Road through to Sunflower Road. Once approved, the certificate will be filed with the Redwood County 
Recorder’s Office. 

 
A motion was made by Council Member Smith and seconded by Council Member Arentson to approve the 

Reflection Prairie Addition Plat Correction Pursuant to Minn. Stat. §505.174. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 
 
Public Works Project Coordinator Jim Doering introduced the 2024 Solid Waste Review Committee.  

 
Mr. Doering stated Staff is recommending the development of a special review committee of the Residential 

Solid Waste Collection RFP and initial meeting at 3:00 p.m. June 25, 2024.  Recommended appointees include Mayor 
Tom Quackenbush, and Council Members Matt Smith and Larry Arentson. The Council Approved the RFP and 
solicitation of waste haulers on May 21, 2024. Responses to the RFP are due on June 25, 2024, at 11:00 a.m. for the 
appointed committee members and Staff to summarize the quotes and present a recommendation to award by July 16, 
2024.  Staff members will include City Administrator Keith Muetzel, City Attorney Trenton Damman, and Public 
Works Project Coordinator Jim Doering. This will allow time for the awarded hauler to coordinate with the current 
franchise holder to ensure a smooth transition. This will also allow for an RFP required public informational meeting to 
be held prior to the transition in order to introduce the awarded hauler and review Chapter 3, Section 3.20 of the 
Redwood Falls City Code with the residents of Redwood Falls.   

 
A motion was made by Council Member Sandgren and seconded by Council Member Kerkhoff to approve the 

2024 Solid Waste Review Committee. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 
 
Council Member Smith stated he received a complaint from a resident regarding the burn pile on Peabody Road 

and the amount of smoke blowing towards the resident’s property. The burn pile had been unintentionally started and the 
Fire Department was able to extinguish the pile. The complaint was referred to City Staff and the issue was quickly 
addressed. 

 
City Administrator Muetzel stated the burn pile is not typically used when wind is not favorable. Unfortunately, the 

burn pile can be inadvertently ignited if it is disturbed, especially during dry periods.  
 
Public Works Project Coordinator Doering stated Staff has received inquiries about relocating the burn pile. 

However, DNR foresters that approve the permit for the City think where it is currently located is ideal to control the 
burning. Residents are encouraged to contact City Staff during business hours or the non-emergency police department 
number after-hours, if there are any concerns with the burn pile.   

 
Public Works Project Coordinator Doering stated the Water Department worked quickly to repair two water leaks 

over the weekend between the Fire Department and St. Catherine’s Catholic Church. Water was shut off for a portion of the 
day while repairs were made.  
 

Bills and Claims were presented to the Council for informational purposes.  No questions, comments or concerns 
were raised.  
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There being no further business, a motion was made by Council Member Arentson and seconded by Council 

Member Kerkhoff to adjourn the meeting at 5:53 p.m. Motion passed by unanimous vote. 

 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
_________________________________  _________________________________ 
Keith Muetzel      Tom Quackenbush 
City Administrator     Mayor 
 
 

 



 Amy Kerkhoff 
Accounts Receivable/Customer Service Coordinator 

Phone:  507-616-7400 
Fax:  507-637-2417 

akerkhoff@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

333 South Washington Street, PO Box 526, Redwood Falls, MN 56283-0526 
www.ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

AGENDA RECOMMENDATION 

Meeting Date: July 2, 2024 

Agenda Item: Resolution No. 36 of 2024 – Resolution Adopting Assessments for Delinquent Utility Accounts  
Resolution No. 37 of 2024 – Resolution Adopting Assessments for Unpaid Surcharges 

Recommendation/Action Requested: Open public hearing to discuss proposed resolutions.  After discussions are held, 
close the public hearing.  Read the resolutions or make a motion to waive the reading of the resolutions.  If there are no 
concerns, adopt proposed resolutions by motion in accordance with Chapter 4 of the City Charter. 

Summary/Overview:  Attached for your consideration are two resolutions handling delinquent utility and surcharges 
that are 30 days past due.  Similar resolutions are brought to the Council on a quarterly basis in order to improve the time 
between the delinquent utility bill and our ability to disclose the information to new owners.  The delinquent account 
resolutions will be presented at the first meeting in January, April, July, and October.  Staff recommends approval of the 
resolutions as mentioned above. 

Delinquent Process: 

• Delinquent letters are mailed to the utility account holders.

• Delinquent letters are then mailed to the property owners if not collected from account holders.

• Pending assessments are published two weeks prior to the Public Hearing.

• Any unpaid balance is then brought to the Council to be approved by resolution.

• Pending assessments passed by resolution and still outstanding as of November 1 will be charged a $50 fee and
then transferred to Redwood County to be assessed on the tax rolls.

Attachments: Resolution No. 36 of 2024 
Resolution No. 37 of 2024 

7A



RESOLUTION NO. 36 OF 2024 

RESOLUTION ADOPTING ASSESSMENTS FOR DELINQUENT UTILITY ACCOUNTS 

 

WHEREAS, Section 9.02 of the Home Rule Charter of the City of Redwood Falls provides that the City Council may provide by Ordinance 
that the costs of any utility services provided to a property located within the City of Redwood Falls may be assessed against the property benefited 
and collected in a like manner as are special assessments; and 

 
WHEREAS, Section 3.04, Subd. 8(D) of the Redwood Falls City Code of Ordinances provides that each utility account which is more than 

thirty (30) days delinquent may, when authorized by Resolution of the City Council, be certified by the City Administrator of the City of Redwood 
Falls to the County Auditor for payment in a single installment; and 
 

WHEREAS, certain accounts, as listed on this resolution, have been established with the Redwood Falls Public Utilities Department for 
the purpose of providing utility services to the premises specified for each account listed therein, said premises being located in the City of 
Redwood Falls, Redwood County, Minnesota; and 

 
WHEREAS, there is an outstanding balance that is more than thirty (30) days delinquent on the customer accounts listed below in the 

amount as set forth therein; and 
 

WHEREAS, pursuant to proper notice duly given as required by law, the council has met and heard and passed upon all objections to the 
proposed assessment of delinquent utility accounts listed below. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF REDWOOD FALLS, MINNESOTA:  

 
1. The properties listed below are hereby specially assessed in the amount specified for each parcel.  The amounts certified may 

include a $50.00 assessment fee. 
2. Such assessments shall be payable in a single installment. 
3. The owner of any property so assessed may, at any time prior to certification of the assessment to the County Auditor, pay the whole 

of the assessment on such property to the City Treasurer. 
4. Before certification of the assessment to the County Auditor, the City Administrator or other authorized official, is authorized and 

directed to accept partial prepayment of the assessment, but not less than 50% of the total amount of any assessment, and reduce 
the amount certified to the County Auditor accordingly. Partial prepayment may be accepted only during the 30-day period following 
approval of the assessment. 

5. The Accounts Receivable Coordinator shall forthwith transmit certified duplicates of the assessments to the county auditor to be 

extended on the property tax lists of the county. Such assessments shall be collected and paid over in the same manner as other 

municipal taxes. 

ACCOUNT LEGAL DESCRIPTION PARCEL AMOUNT 

01-03400-01 ORIGINAL, SOUTH 50’ OF WEST 55’ LOT 5 & SOUTH 50’ LOT 6, BLOCK 10 88-200-180 $566.94 

01-03420-04 ORIGINAL, LOT 1, BLOCK 12 88-200-2080 $132.22 

02-00300-08 HITCHCOCK, COMMENCE 180’ WEST OF NORTHEAST CORNER, SOUTH 120’, 
WEST 60’, NORTH 120’, EAST 60’, PART OF NORTH ½ BLOCK, BLOCK 1 

88-424-0080 $491.16 

02-02090-01 HITCHCOCK, LOT 6, BLOCK 7 88-422-1360 $132.22 

02-02400-00 HITCHCOCK, LOT 5, BLOCK 10 88-422-2000 $158.79 

02-03370-03 HITCHCOCK 3RD, LOT 6, BLOCK 4 88-424-0680 $725.14 

02-04630-01 LAMBERTON, LOT 5, BLOCK 1 88-533-0100 $132.22 

02-07130-97 EASTERN, LOT 5, BLOCK 6 88-323-1100 $132.22 

02-07840-03 HITCHCOCK 2ND, LOT 1, BLOCK 7 88-423-1160 $136.49 

02-08210-02 HITCHCOCK 3RD, TRACT 50’ X 120’ EAST SIDE OF BLOCK, BLOCK 3 88-424-0320 $136.49 

03-04320-97 WATSON 3RD, LOTS 5 & 6 EXCEPT COMMENCE 17’ EAST OF SOUTHWEST 
CORNER; THENCE WEST 17’ NORTH TO NORTHWEST CORNER, EAST 50’ 
SOUTHWESTERLY TO POB OF LOT 6, BLOCK 10 

88-867-1740 $132.22 

03-04850-05 WATSON, LOT 9, BLOCK 3 88-867-0440 $185.60 

04-00080-01 NORTHWOOD TERRACE 4TH, LOT 1, BLOCK 3  88-613-0640 $132.51 

06-00590-01 RAMSEY HEIGHTS 3RD, LOT 3, BLOCK 2 88-718-0200 $627.01 

06-02140-04 AUDITOR SUBDIVISION ONE, COMMENCE NORTHWEST LOT 21, THENCE EAST 
40’, SOUTH 240’, WEST 40’, NORTH 240’ TO POB, 01-112-36 

88-001-2031 $132.22 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota, this 2nd day of July 2024. 
 
ATTEST: 

 

                 
Keith T. Muetzel    Tom Quackenbush     
City Administrator   Mayor     

          
(City Seal)         

     Subscribed and sworn to before me  

     This 2nd day of July 2024. 

          

     ________________________________ 



RESOLUTION NO. 37 OF 2024 

RESOLUTION ADOPTING ASSESSMENTS FOR UNPAID SURCHARGES 

 

  WHEREAS, Sections 3.40 and 3.50 of the Redwood Falls City Code of Ordinances prohibit clear water 
drainage into the public sanitary sewer and require an inspection of each building within the City to confirm that there 
is no discharge of prohibited clear water drainage; and  
 
  WHEREAS, said sections provide that in the event a property owner fails to schedule an inspection and/or 
provide the required affidavit proving inspection and compliance, the City may impose a monthly surcharge in an 
amount duly adopted by the City Council and set forth in the City's fee schedule; and  
  
  WHEREAS, Section 3.50, Subd. 9 further provides that if said surcharge is not received by the City, the City 
may assess the unpaid balance against the property and collect in a like manner, as are special assessments.; and
  
  

WHEREAS, on or about the date as hereinafter set forth, surcharges remain unpaid to the City for the 
following described properties, all of which are located in the City of Redwood Falls, Redwood County, Minnesota; 
and  

  
WHEREAS, the owner(s) of said properties has failed or refused to pay the said amount(s); and 
 
WHEREAS, pursuant to proper notice duly given as required by law, the Council has met and heard and 

passed upon all objections to the proposed assessment of unpaid surcharges listed below. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF REDWOOD FALLS, MINNESOTA:  

1. The properties listed below are hereby specially assessed in the amount specified for each parcel.  The 

amounts certified may include a $50.00 assessment fee. 

2. Such assessments shall be payable in a single installment. 
3. The owner of any property so assessed may, at any time prior to certification of the assessment to the 

County Auditor, pay the whole of the assessment on such property to the City Treasurer. 
4. The Accounts Receivable Coordinator shall forthwith transmit certified duplicates of the assessments to 

the county auditor to be extended on the property tax lists of the county.  Such assessments shall be 
collected and paid over in the same manner as other municipal taxes. 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota, this 2nd day of July 2024. 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 

                  
Keith T. Muetzel    Tom Quackenbush     
City Administrator   Mayor     

          
(City Seal)         

          

     Subscribed and sworn to before me  

     This 2nd day of July 2024. 

          

     ________________________________ 

     Notary Public     
 

ACCOUNT # LEGAL DESCRIPTION PARCEL # AMOUNT 

00-00385-00 AUDITOR SUBIVISION 1, SOUTHEAST ½ LOT 3, 36-113-36 88-036-4170 $300.00 

02-07840-03 HITCHCOCK 2nd, LOT 1, BLOCK 7 88-423-1160 $200.00 



 Keith Muetzel 
City Administrator 

Phone:  507-616-7400 
Fax:  507-637-2417 

kmuetzel@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

333 S. Washington Street, PO Box 526, Redwood Falls, MN 56283-0526 
www.ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

Meeting Date:  July 2, 2024 

AGENDA RECOMMENDATION 

Agenda Item:  Accounts Payable/Payroll Coordinator Position 

Recommendation/Action Requested:  Staff will present a recommendation at the July 2 meeting. 

Summary/Overview:  
The reassignment of Rachel Viergutz to our accountant position creates an accounts payable/payroll coordinator 
position vacancy.  The vacancy was posted internally and externally, and eleven applications were received, 
with seven candidates being interviewed.  The hiring committee is scheduled to reconvene and will provide a 
recommendation to the City Council on July 2.     

Attachments:  None 
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 Jim Doering 
Public Works Project Coordinator 

Phone:  507-616-7400 
Fax:  507-637-2417 

jdoering@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

333 S. Washington Street, PO Box 526, Redwood Falls, MN 56283-0526 

www.ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

Meeting Date: July 2, 2024 

AGENDA RECOMMENDATION 

Agenda Item: Recommendation to award the five-year (September 23, 2024 – September 21, 2029), City 
of Redwood Falls Residential Solid Waste Franchise Vendor. 

Recommendation/Action Requested:  The Solid Waste Committee and Staff recommends the award of the 
five-year (September 23, 2024 – September 21, 2029), City of Redwood Falls Residential Solid Waste 
Vendor to West Central Sanitation of Willmar, MN and commence the development of the corresponding 
franchise agreement. 

Summary/Overview: Bids were opened on June 25, 2024, at 11:00 a.m. and read aloud in the Council 
Chambers. The three proposals opened and read allowed in the order received were: Sweetman Sanitation 
Inc. of Echo, Waste Management of MN, and West Central Sanitation of Willmar. West Central Sanitation 
of Willmar was the apparent low bidder as residential hauler for the next five-year franchise agreement.  The 
Solid Waste Committee met the same day at 3:00 p.m. to review the abstract and rank responses to the RFP.  
The ranked cumulative scores out of 300 total points are as follows: 291-West Central Sanitation, 268-
Sweetman Sanitation and 195-Waste Management of MN.  

Based on the cumulative scoring, the Solid Waste Committee recommends the approval of West Central 
Sanitation of Willmar to provide services for the next five-year Solid Waste Franchise Agreement.  Upon 
approval Staff will work with West Central Sanitation to develop the Solid Waste Franchise Agreement 
which will be presented to the Redwood Falls City Council on August 6th for final approval.  

Attachments: RFP Bid Tab 
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2024 Solid Waste Hauler RFP Bid Opening 

RFP proposals were opened and read aloud at 11:00 a.m. June 25, 2024, in the City of Redwood Falls Council Chambers

Proposals were reviewed and ranked by the appointed Solid Waste Committee at 3:00 p.m. June 25, 2024.

Bid Tab. Time Stamp Container Container Container Valet Tag Rate Enviro Surcharge 1.5 yd 3 yd 6 yd 10 yd Cumulative Points 

Vendor & Date Submitted 35 Gal 64 Gal 96 Gal Service Extra Refuse Yes/No Dumpster Tip Dumpster Tip Dumpster Tip Dumpster Tip Received/300

West Central Sanitation 6/25/2024 10:57 a.m. 7.50$                          8.40$                          10.90$                       10.00$                       2.50$                          No 40.00$                       55.00$                       75.00$                       150.00$                    291

Waste Management of MN 6/25/2024 9:25 a.m. 14.10$                       15.78$                       18.85$                       No Charge 5.00$                          Yes 155.00$                    185.00$                    195

Home Town Sanitation Services No Bid 0

Sweetman Sanitation 6/25/2024 8:34 a.m. 8.50$                          11.00$                       13.00$                       No Charge 3.00$                          No 30.00$                       60.00$                       120.00$                    200.00$                    268

R&E Sanitation No Bid 0

Soutwest Sanitation No Bid 0

Olson Sanitation No Bid 0















Ross Nachreiner 
Redwood Falls Parks & Rec Director 

Phone:  507-616-7444 
Fax:  507-644-2199 

rnachreiner@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

901 Cook Street, Redwood Falls, MN 56283-1943 
www.redwoodareacommunitycenter.com 

AGENDA RECOMMENDATION 

Council Meeting Date: July 2nd, 2024 

Agenda Item: Resolution No. 38 of 2024 – Resolution Accepting Donation for Ramsey Park Improvements 

Recommendation/Action Requested:  Read the proposed Resolution or make a motion to waive the reading of 
the Resolution. Discuss the proposed Resolution. If no concerns, adopt proposed Resolution by motion in 
accordance with Chapter 4 of the City Charter.  

Summary/Overview: Attached is Resolution 38 of 2024 accepting a financial donation in the amount of 
$13,000 from The Friends of Ramsey Park.  The donation allows us to meet the required match ($7,000.00) per 
grant guidelines. 

City staff would like to thank the Friends of the Park for their generous donation.  We would also like to 
recognize their continued hard work with the fundraising efforts they do to make the park what it is today. 

Staff is requesting approval to accept the financial donation from The Friends of the Park. 

Attachments: Resolution No. 38 of 2024 
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RESOLUTION NO. 38 OF 2024 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING A DONATION TO THE CITY. 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Redwood Falls is generally authorized to accept donations of real and 
personal property pursuant to Minnesota Statutes Section 465.03 et seq. for the benefit of its citizens 
and is specifically authorized to accept gifts; and 
 
WHEREAS, the following persons and entities have offered to contribute the cash amounts set forth 
below to the City: 
 
 Name of Donor    Amount 
 Friends of Ramsey Park   $13,000.00 
 
WHEREAS, the terms or conditions of the donations, if any, are as follows: 
  
 Terms or Conditions 
 Contribution towards Ramsey Park improvements which include the building and installation 
of the bathroom facility near the Zeb Gray Shelter, installation of a lift station at the Falls Bathroom 
complex, and boring of new water & sewer lines to each of the facilities. 
 
WHEREAS, all such donations have been contributed to the City for the benefit of its citizens, as 
allowed by law; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is appropriate to accept the donations offered. 
 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
REDWOOD FALLS, MINNESOTA AS FOLLOWS: 

1. The donations described above are accepted and shall be used to establish and/or operate 
services either alone or in cooperation with others, as allowed by law. 
2. The city clerk is hereby authorized, if requested, to issue receipts to each donor 
acknowledging the city’s receipt of the donor’s donation. 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota this 2nd day 
of July 2024. 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________________  ___________________________________ 
Keith Muetzel        Tom Quackenbush 
City Administrator     Mayor 
 
 
 
(City Seal)      Subscribed and sworn to before me this 
       2nd day of July 2024. 
 
       _________________________________ 
       Notary Public 



Ross Nachreiner 
Redwood Falls Parks & Rec Director 

Phone:  507-616-7444 
Fax:  507-644-2199 

rnachreiner@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

333 S. Washington Street, PO Box 526, Redwood Falls, MN 56283-0526 
www.ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

AGENDA RECOMMENDATION 

Meeting Date: July 2nd, 2024 

Agenda Item: Resolution No. 39 of 2024 

Recommendation/Action Requested:  Read the proposed Resolution or make a motion to waive the reading of 
the Resolution. Discuss the proposed Resolution. If there are no concerns, adopt the proposed Resolution by 
motion in accordance with Chapter 4 of the City Charter.  

Summary/Overview: Attached is a resolution to approve the quote and enter into a contract with Salonek, Inc 
to construct a Bathroom facility at Memorial Park Baseball Field. 

Within the Parks and Recreation Master Plan as well as a capital budgeted item for 2024 is the construction of a 
new bathroom facility at the Memorial Park Baseball Field.  We are currently using the bathrooms in the old 
pool building which as you can imagine are outdated and not ADA compatible.  The new restroom facility will 
be a two door/stall unisex restroom built within the fenced area of the field just east of the concessions stand 
and will structurally match the concessions stand.  The contractor is responsible for water and sewer hook-up to 
the facility.  Attached you will see a general sketch of the restroom & the scope of work for this project. 

For 2024 we had budgeted $100,000.00 for this project.  I have secured additional $5,000.00 in donations from 
both the Redwood Valley Baseball Association and $5,000.00 from the Redwood American Legion Post #38.  
The remaining funds will come out of the Park & Rec capital budget. 

I was able to obtain two quotes for the project.  Salonek, Inc.’s quote was $138,520.00 while Everstrong 
Construction’s quote was $151,530.72.   

I would ask that you approve Resolution 39 of 2024 and accept the quote from Salonek, Inc in the amount of 
$138,520.00. 

Attachments: 

Resolution No. 39 of 2024 
Bid from Salonek, Inc 
Bid from Everstrong Construction 
Site Plan & Scope of Work to be Completed 
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RESOLUTION NO. 39 OF 2024 

AUTHORIZATION TO EXECUTE QUOTE  

FOR CONSTRUCTION OF A BATHROOM FACILITY AT MEMORIAL PARK 

 

 

 WHEREAS, the City of Redwood Falls (“City”) is authorized to enter into a contract with Salonek, 
Inc, of Springfield, MN pursuant to Minnesota Statutes Section 412.221, subd. 2 for the benefit of its 
citizens; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Salonek, Inc. of Springfield, MN has provided a complete quote; and 
 
 WHEREAS, additional quotes were requested from two other parties, Everstrong Construction in 
the amount of $151,530.72.00 and Deming Construction in the amount of $23,500 (Block Layers Only-not 
a General Contractor); and  
 
 WHEREAS, the quote provided outlines the specific professional tasks to be completed by 
Salonek, Inc. and is estimated to be $138,520.00 which is not to be exceeded without prior authorization; 
and 
 
 FURTHERMORE, the Parks and Recreation Director shall be listed as the Project Representative 
on behalf of the City of Redwood Falls; and 
 
 FURTHERMORE, the Mayor and/or City Administrator are authorized to execute the 
corresponding contract, and any pre-applications, grant applications, subsequent federal and state grant 
agreements and amendments and negotiate in good faith, as are necessary to implement the project 
pursuant to the Redwood Falls Procurement Policy.  

 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF REDWOOD 

FALLS, MINNESOTA, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

1. The quote and corresponding contract described above are approved and shall be executed 
in the form submitted to the City Council and made a part of this Resolution by reference.  

 
2. The quote and corresponding contract described above shall be maintained and insured as 

allowed by law.  
  

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota, 
approves the request contingent upon compliance with all the requirements of the Minnesota State Statutes. 
 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota this 2nd       
day of July 2024. 
 
ATTEST: 
 
___________________________________  ___________________________________ 
Keith Muetzel        Tom Quackenbush  
City Administrator     Mayor 
 
 
(City Seal)      Subscribed and sworn to before me this 
       2nd day of July 2024. 
 
       _________________________________ 
       Notary Public 
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 Kari Klages 
Finance Director 

City of Redwood Falls 
Phone:  507-616-7400  

Fax:  507-637-2417 
kklages@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

333 S. Washington Street, PO Box 526, Redwood Falls, MN 56283-0526 
www.ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

AGENDA RECOMMENDATION 

Meeting Date: July 2, 2024 

Agenda Item: Resolution No. 40 of 2024 – Resolution Accepting Donation from the Redwood Falls Fire Relief 
Association 

Recommendation/Action Requested:  Read the proposed Resolution or make a motion to waive the reading of 
the Resolution. Discuss the proposed Resolution. If no concerns, adopt proposed Resolution by motion in 
accordance with Chapter 4 of the City Charter.  

Summary/Overview: Minnesota Statute 465.03 gives the city authority to receive donations and requires them 
to be formally accepted by resolution, adopted by a two-thirds vote of the Council.  

Attached is a resolution accepting two financial donations in a total amount of $4,615.94. The donations are to 
be used towards the purchase of a pressure washer system and a rescue training dummy for use by the Redwood 
Falls Fire Department.   

Attachments: Resolution No. 40 of 2024 
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RESOLUTION NO. 40 OF 2024 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING A DONATION TO THE CITY. 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Redwood Falls is generally authorized to accept donations of real and 
personal property pursuant to Minnesota Statutes Section 465.03 et seq. for the benefit of its citizens 
and is specifically authorized to accept gifts; and 
 
WHEREAS, the following persons and entities have offered to contribute the cash amounts set forth 
below to the City: 
 
 Name of Donor     Amount 
 Redwood Falls Fire Relief Association   $2,801.35 
 Redwood Falls Fire Relief Association   $1,814.59  
 
WHEREAS, the terms or conditions of the donations, if any, are as follows: 
  
 Terms or Conditions 
 Purchase of a pressure washer system and supplies and a rescue training dummy.  
 
WHEREAS, all such donations have been contributed to the City for the benefit of its citizens, as 
allowed by law; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is appropriate to accept the donations offered. 
 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
REDWOOD FALLS, MINNESOTA AS FOLLOWS: 
 

1. The donations described above are accepted and shall be used to establish and/or operate 
services either alone or in cooperation with others, as allowed by law. 
2. The city clerk is hereby authorized, if requested, to issue receipts to each donor 
acknowledging the City’s receipt of the donor’s donation. 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota this 2nd day 
of July 2024. 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________________  ___________________________________ 
Keith Muetzel        Tom Quackenbush 
City Administrator     Mayor 
 
 
 
(City Seal)      Subscribed and sworn to before me this 
       2nd day of July 2024. 
 
       _________________________________ 
       Notary Public 



Redwood Falls Public Library 
509 South Lincoln Street 

Redwood Falls, MN 56283-1645 
Phone:  507-616-7420 

Fax:  507-627-5004 
rwf@ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

www.redwoodfallslibrary.org 

Council Meeting Date: July 2, 2024 

Agenda Item: Resolution No. 41 of 2024 – Resolution Accepting Donation from Redwood Area Library Foundation 
for $7,365.00 

Recommendation/Action Requested: Read the proposed Resolution or make a motion to waive the reading of the 
Resolution. Discuss the proposed Resolution. If there are no concerns, adopt proposed Resolution by motion in 
accordance with Chapter 4 of the City Charter.  

Summary/Overview: Attached is Resolution 41 of 2024 accepting a donation from the Redwood Area Library 
Foundation.  $2,365.00 is donated by Anne and Chad Johnson for a fiberglass book bench to be placed on a cement 
slab at the Library in memory of Anne’s mother. This had been approved in 2019 by the City Council and had not 
been re-addressed post-Covid, so it was advised to request current approval.  The Capital Bonding Application 
completed by Engan Associates became a much higher expense than previously estimated.  The City Council had 
approved $5,200.00 at the April 2nd meeting from the Capital Projects Fund.  The total amount due is $16,835.25.  
The Redwood Area Library Foundation has agreed to pay $5,500.00 as agreed to with Engan Associates, with the 
balance of $6,135.25 as an in-kind donation for a physical marker with their name and logo near the entrance of the 
Expansion space when it occurs. 

Staff is requesting approval to accept the financial donation from the Redwood Area Library Foundation for the 
book bench and Engan Associates balance due. 

Attachments: Resolution No. 41 of 2024 
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RESOLUTION NO. 41 OF 2024 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING DONATIONS TO THE CITY. 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Redwood Falls is generally authorized to accept donations of real and 
personal property pursuant to Minnesota Statutes Section 465.03 et seq. for the benefit of its citizens 
and is specifically authorized to accept gifts; and 
 
WHEREAS, the following persons and entities have offered to contribute a digital sign and a cash 
amount set forth below to the City: 
 
 Name of Donor      Amount 
 Redwood Area Library Foundation    $7,365.00 
  
WHEREAS, the terms or conditions of the donations, if any, are as follows: 
  
 Terms or Conditions 

Contribution of $5,500.00 to pay Engan Associates for Library Capital Bonding application.   
$2,365.00 to pay for a fiberglass book bench from the family of Anne and Chad Johnson. 

 
WHEREAS, all such donations have been contributed to the City for the benefit of its citizens, as 
allowed by law; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is appropriate to accept the donations offered. 
 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
REDWOOD FALLS, MINNESOTA AS FOLLOWS: 
 

1. The donations described above are accepted and shall be used to establish and/or operate 
services either alone or in cooperation with others, as allowed by law. 
2. The city clerk is hereby authorized, if requested, to issue receipts to each donor 
acknowledging the City’s receipt of the donor’s donation. 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Redwood Falls, Minnesota this 2nd day 
of July 2024. 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________________  ___________________________________ 
Keith Muetzel           Tom Quackenbush 
City Administrator     Mayor 
 
 
 
(City Seal)      Subscribed and sworn to before me this 
       2nd day of  July 2024. 
 
       _________________________________ 
       Notary Public 



303 East 3rd Street 

PO Box 526 

Redwood Falls, MN 56283-0526 

Phone:  507-637-4005 

Fax:  507-637-1347 

www.ci.redwood-falls.mn.us 

Meeting Date: July 2, 2024 

Agenda Recommendation 

Agenda Item:  Approve Results of State Mandated Body Worn Camera Audit 

Recommendation/Action Requested: Staff recommends approval of the audit 

Summary/Overview: 

On, or about, June 1, 2022 Redwood Falls Police Department deployed the Axon Body Worn Camera (BWC) 
system for use by officers while on patrol.  By state statute, once a BWC system is deployed by a law 
enforcement agency an audit of the system and all the data collected must be audited every two years from the 
date of deployment.   

On April 12, 2024, Lynn Lembcke of Lynn Lembcke Consulting conducted the very first audit of the RFPD 
BWC program.  On June 17, 2024, Police Chief Jason Cotner received the final draft of her report and 
confirmed no discrepancies in any of the audit categories were found.   

Per statute, the final draft of the audit must be submitted to the Redwood Falls City Council as well as several 
officials with the State of Minnesota who oversee BWC Data Practices.     

Attachments: 

2024 BWC Audit 
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INDEPENDENT AUDIT REPORT 

 

Chief Jason Cotner 
Redwood Falls Police Department 
303 E. 3rd St., Box 526 
Redwood Falls, MN  56283 
 
Dear Chief Cotner: 
  
An independent audit of the Redwood Falls Police Department’s Portable Recording System 

(body-worn cameras (BWCs)) was conducted on April 12, 2024.  The objective of the audit was 

to verify Redwood Falls Police Department’s compliance with Minnesota Statutes §§13.825 and 
626.8473.   

Data elements the audit includes: 

Minnesota Statute §13.825 

• Data Classification 

• Retention of Data 

• Access by Data Subjects 

• Inventory of Portable Recording System Technology 

• Use of Agency-Issued Portable Recording Systems 

• Authorization to Access Data 

• Sharing Among Agencies 
 
Minnesota Statute §626.8473 

• Public Comment 

• Body-worn Camera Policy 
 
   
The Redwood Falls Police Department is located in Redwood County, Minnesota and employs 
twelve (12) peace officers.  The Redwood Falls Police Department utilizes Axon body-worn 
cameras and Evidence.com cloud-based evidence management storage.  The audit covers the 
period June 1, 2022, through March 31, 2024. 
 
 
Audit Requirement:  Data Classification 

 

Determine if the data collected by BWCs are appropriately classified. 

 

 Redwood Falls Police Department BWC data is presumptively private.  All data collected during 
the audit period is classified as private or nonpublic data.  The Redwood Falls Police Department 
had no incidents of the discharge of a firearm by a peace officer, use of force that resulted in 
substantial bodily harm, requests from data subjects for the data to be made accessible to the 
public, or court orders directing the agency to release the BWC data to the public.  
 
No discrepancies noted. 



 

 

Audit Requirement:  Retention of Data 

 

Determine if the data collected by BWCs are appropriately retained and destroyed in 

accordance with statutes. 

 
The Redwood Falls Police Department utilizes the General Records Retention Schedule for 
Minnesota Cities and agency specified retention periods in Evidence.com. At the conclusion of a 
BWC recording, officers assign meta data, including an Evidence.com category, to the recording.  
Each Evidence.com category has an associated retention period.  Upon reaching its retention 
date, evidence is systematically deleted. Deletion of the data is captured in the audit trail.   
 
A report was produced from Evidence.com for all BWC data collected during the audit period.  
Records from the Evidence Created Report were reviewed, and the date and time the data was 
created was verified against the deletion date. All records were deleted in accordance with the 
record retention schedule. A group of uncategorized videos were deleted in less than the ninety 
(90) days required by statute due to a system error created by Axon Support in the course of 
updating the retention period of uncategorized video to “until manually deleted.” Randomly 
selected records from the Evidence Created Report were verified against audit trail reports, and 
each record was deleted or maintained in accordance with the record retention.    
 
The Redwood Falls Police Department had received no requests from data subjects to retain 
BWC data beyond the applicable retention period. 
 
No discrepancies noted. 

 

Audit Requirement:  Access by Data Subjects 

 

Determine if individuals who are the subject of collected data have access to the data, and if the 

data subject requests a copy of the data, other individuals who do not consent to its release are 

redacted. 

  
BWC data is available to data subjects and access may be requested by submission of a City of 
Redwood Falls Information Disclosure Request form.  During the audit period, the Redwood 
Falls Police Department had received no requests to view BWC video but did receive and fulfill 
requests for copies of BWC video from data subjects. The requested video contained no data 
subjects other than the requester. The request form is scanned into the case file and the request is 
documented in the records management system dissemination log. 
 
No discrepancies noted. 

 
Audit Requirement:  Inventory of Portable Recording System Technology 
 

Determine the total number of recording devices owned and maintained by the agency; a daily 

record of the total number of recording devices actually deployed and used by officers, the 

policies and procedures for use of portable recording systems by required by section 626.8473; 

and the total amount of recorded audio and video collected by the portable recording system and  



 

 

maintained by the agency, the agency’s retention schedule for the data, the agency’s procedures 
for destruction of the data, and that the data are available to the public. 

 
Redwood Falls Police Department’s BWC inventory consists of thirteen (13) devices.  An 
inventory report produced from Evidence.com detailed the total number of recording devices 
owned and maintained by the agency.  The inventory included the device model, serial number, 
device name, the officer assigned to the device, date of last upload, device status, error status, 
firmware version, and warranty date.  
  
The Redwood Falls Police Department BWC policy governs the use of portable recording 
systems by peace officers while in the performance of their duties.  The Department’s BWC 
policy requires officers to conduct a function test of their BWC at the beginning of each shift and 
to report any malfunction during testing or at any other time to their supervisor.  Peace officers 
were trained on the use of the portable recording system by Axon during implementation.  Newly 
hired officers are trained as part of their field training program. 
 
Officers working on randomly selected dates, and randomly selected calls for service, were 
verified against the Evidence Created Report and confirmed that BWCs are being deployed and 
officers are wearing and activating their BWCs.  A comparison between the total number of 
BWC videos created per quarter and total calls for shows a consistent collection of BWC data.   
  
Evidence.com queries and the Evidence Created Report detail the total amount of BWC data 
created, stored/maintained, and deleted.   
 
The Redwood Falls Police Department utilizes the General Records Retention Schedule for 
Minnesota Cities and agency specified retention periods in Evidence.com.  BWC video is fully 
deleted from Evidence.com upon reaching its scheduled deletion date.  Meta data and audit trails 
are maintained in Evidence.com after deletion of BWC audio and video.  BWC data is available 
upon request, and access may be requested by submission of a City of Redwood Falls 
Information Disclosure Request form. 
 
No discrepancies noted. 

 

Audit Requirement:  Use of Agency-Issued Portable Recording Systems 
 
Determine if peace officers are only allowed to use portable recording systems issued and 

maintained by the officer’s agency. 
 

The Redwood Falls Police Department’s BWC policy states that officers may use only 
department-issued BWCs while engaged in the performance of official duties. 
  
No discrepancies noted. 

 

Audit Requirement:  Authorization to Access Data 

 
Determine if the agency complies with sections 13.05, Subd. 5, and 13.055 in the operation of  

 



 

 

 

portable recording systems and in maintaining portable recording system data. 

 
Random reviews of BWC data are conducted to ensure BWC data is being properly categorized 
and that BWCs are being used in compliance with policy.   
 
Nonpublic BWC data is only available to persons whose work assignment reasonably requires 
access to the data.  User access to BWC data is managed by the assignment of roles and 
permissions in Evidence.com.  Permissions are based on staff work assignments.  Roles and 
Permissions are administered by the Chief of Police and Assistant Chief.  Access to 
Evidence.com is password protected and requires dual authentication.   
 
The agency’s BWC Policy governs access to BWC data.  Agency personnel may access BWC 
data only when there is a legitimate law enforcement or data administration need for doing so.  
Agency personnel are prohibited from accessing BWC data for non-business reasons and from 
sharing the data for non-law-enforcement-related purposes.  User access to data is captured in the 
audit trail.  The BWC policy states that supervisors shall monitor for compliance with the policy, 
and noncompliance may constitute misconduct and subject individuals to disciplinary action and 
criminal penalties pursuant to Minn. Stat. § 13.09. 
 
When BWC data is deleted from Evidence.com, its contents cannot be determined.  The 
Redwood Falls Police Department has had no security breaches.  A BCA CJIS Security audit 
was conducted in May of 2022. 
 
No discrepancies noted. 

 
 

Audit Requirement:  Sharing Among Agencies 

 

Determine if nonpublic BWC data is shared with other law enforcement agencies, government 

entities, or federal agencies. 

  

The Redwood Falls Police Department’s BWC policy allows for the sharing of data with other 
law enforcement agencies for legitimate law enforcement purposes only and for the sharing of 
data with prosecutors, courts and other criminal justice entities as provided by law.  Law 
enforcement agencies seeking access to BWC data submit a written request.  Data is downloaded 
from Evidence.com and shared via iCrimeFighter software. Written requests are retained and 
sharing of data is documented in the records management system dissemination log. 
 
No discrepancies noted. 

 
Audit Requirement:  Biennial Audit 

 
Determine if the agency maintains records showing the date and time the portable recording 

system data were collected, the applicable classification of the data, how the data are used, and  

 

 



whether data are destroyed as required. 

Evidence.com and the Evidence Created Report document the date and time portable recording 
system data were collected and deleted.  All BWC data collected during the audit period is 
classified as private or nonpublic data.  The Evidence.com audit trail documents how the data are 
used. The audit trail is maintained in Evidence.com after deletion of video. The Evidence.com 
audit trail documents each and every action taken from the creation of the recording to its 
deletion, as well as access to the audit trail after BWC has been deleted. 

No discrepancies noted. 

Audit Requirement:  Portable Recording System Vendor 

Determine if portable recording system data stored in the cloud, is stored in accordance with 

security requirements of the United States Federal Bureau of Investigation Criminal Justice 

Information Services Division Security Policy 5.4 or its successor version. 

An Axon CJIS Compliance White paper outlines the specific security policies and practices for 
Evidence.com and how they are compliant with the CJIS Security Policy.  Axon has signed the 
CJIS Security Addendum in all states and has performed statewide CJIS-related vendor 
requirements in Minnesota.  Axon has incorporated the CJIS Security Addendum by reference 
into the Axon Master Services and Purchase Agreement.  Axon maintains signed CJIS Security 
Addendum certification pages for Axon personnel.  Authorized Axon personnel are required to 
complete Level 4 CJIS Security Training upon assignment and biennially thereafter.   

No discrepancies noted. 

Audit Requirement:  Public Comment 

Determine if the law enforcement agency provided an opportunity for public comment before it 

purchased or implemented a portable recording system and if the governing body with 

jurisdiction over the budget of the law enforcement agency provided an opportunity for public 

comment at a regularly scheduled meeting.   

The Redwood Falls Police Department solicited for public comment by notice in their official 
publication. Public comments were accepted mail or email.  The Redwood Falls City Council 
held a public hearing at their November 16, 2021, meeting. The BWC program was implemented 
in June of 2022.   

No discrepancies noted. 

Audit Requirement:  Body-worn Camera Policy 

Determine if a written policy governing the use of portable recording systems has been 



established and is enforced. 

The Redwood Falls Police Department has established and enforces a BWC policy.  The policy 
was compared to the requirements of Minn. Stat. § 626.8473.  The agency’s policy includes all 
minimum requirements of Minn. Stat. § 626.8473, Subd. 3.  The BWC policy is posted on the 
agency’s website. 

No discrepancies noted. 

This report was prepared exclusively for the City of Redwood Falls and Redwood Falls Police 
Department by Lynn Lembcke Consulting.  The findings in this report are impartial and based on 
information and documentation provided and examined.   

Dated:  June 17, 2024 Lynn Lembcke Consulting 

______________________________ 
Lynn Lembcke 
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